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   Ms. Luo Yuyan  
Personal Profile 
Ms. Luo Yuyan was born in March 1966 in Yangzhou, Jiangsu Province. She is a senior 
engineer and a provincial-level representative inheritor of Yang-style bonsai 
techniques. Ms. Luo is also a member of the CPC. Currently, she serves as a Level IV 
Division Rank Official at the Housing and Urban-Rural Development Bureau of Taizhou 
Municipality, in charge of the work of the bonsai exhibition hall. She is the president 
of the Flower, Penjing & Stone Branch of the Chinese Society of Landscape 
Architecture, a member and vice president of the Women's Committee of the Chinese 
Society of Landscape Architecture, an executive director of the Rhododendron Branch 
of China Flower Association, and the director of the Yangtze River Delta Urban 
Landscaping and Greening Cooperation Network. Additionally, she is an executive 
director of the Jiangsu Association of Landscape Architecture. 
 
Ms. Yuyan Luo has been recognized as an advanced individual by the Ministry of 
Housing and Urban-Rural Development, awarded the "Outstanding Woman" title by 
the Provincial Housing and Urban-Rural Development Department, and has received 
multiple honors as an advanced individual in Taizhou's greening efforts, including 
third-class merit awards. She was also recognized as a "New Taizhou Construction 
Contributor" and has twice won the "Taizhou Jumper Award". She is a member of the 
expert database of the Ministry of Housing and Urban-Rural Development and the 
Jiangsu Provincial Department of Housing and Urban-Rural Development. 

http://www.wbffbonsai.org/
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Ms. Yuyan Luo has been engaged in the flower and bonsai industry for 40 years. In 
1986, she became an apprentice of the Chinese bonsai master Wan Ruiming and is 
the seventh-generation inheritor of the "Wan Shi” Yangzhou School bonsai 
techniques. She was awarded the title of "National Young and Middle-aged Bonsai 
Star" in the first national bonsai competition. Her works have won numerous national 
and provincial awards, and her papers and bonsai works have been included in the 
"Chinese Bonsai Schools Series".  
 
Ms. Luo She has organized the 11th National Penjing Exhibition and the 9th Jiangsu 
Horticultural Exposition, as well as a series of events of the Yang School Bonsai Art 
Seminar and the 50th Anniversary Achievement Exhibition of Qingquan Zhao's Bonsai 
Art. She has organized or co-organized multiple flower and garden-related activities 
at the Jiangsu Province Garden Expo, as well as provincial and city-level bonsai 
professional skills competitions, and has served as a judge (evaluator) for many 
provincial and city bonsai exhibitions and skill competitions.  
 
In 2008, she successfully applied for the inclusion of Yang School (Taizhou) Bonsai 
Techniques as a national intangible cultural heritage item in the second batch. Her 
works were showcased on CCTV in 2023 and 2024, and she released first-day covers, 
electronic postal signs, and the "Bonsai Elegance" postal albums. Ms. Yuyan Luo has 
promoted research on the industrialization of bonsai and created cultural and 
creative bonsai gifts. She implemented the "Bonsai Craftsmanship Digital Project" to 
create comprehensive, authoritative, and long-lasting digital records for the 
preservation and inheritance of Yang School bonsai techniques.  
 
Furthermore, Ms. Luo has continuously held the "Bonsai Lectures" to promote bonsai 
techniques in schools, communities, and senior universities. she has launched "Cloud 
Classes" and "Micro Classes" to promote and popularize bonsai techniques from 
multiple perspectives, laying a solid foundation for the application of Chinese bonsai 
techniques as a UNESCO Intangible Cultural Heritage. 
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